
Peace River / Manasota Regional Water Supply Authority

Regional Integrated Loop System Phase 3A Interconnect Project

Contractor's Bid Tabulation Summary

Bids received November 19, 2009

 Proposed Total Contract Price 

Schedule A Ductile Iron Pipe 

 Proposed Total Contract Price 

Schedule A with Alternate 1 

 Proposed Total Contract Price 

Schedule B Steel Pipe 

 Proposed Total Contract Price 

Schedule B with Alternate 1 

PBS&J Estimate $32,301,216.50 $37,361,216.50 $32,301,216.50 $37,361,216.50

Forsberg Construction, Inc. No Bid No Bid $19,085,985.00 $21,879,705.00

Garney Companies, Inc. No Bid No Bid $15,857,737.35 $18,385,256.35

GlobeTec Construction No Bid No Bid $16,284,040.00 $19,259,580.00

John D. Stephens, Inc. No Bid No Bid $19,196,347.00 $22,026,603.00

Mitchell & Stark Const. Co., Inc. $19,544,900.50 $22,295,301.50 $17,755,120.50 $20,505,521.50

Morgan Contracting, Inc. No Bid No Bid $15,519,025.00 $18,393,485.00

Reynolds, Inc. No Bid No Bid $16,340,730.00 $18,836,710.00

Westra Construction Corp. No Bid No Bid $17,280,120.00 $19,883,825.00

Woodruff & Sons, Inc. $19,781,489.33 $22,374,275.68 No Bid No Bid

Corrected value.  Addition error in bid tabulation.


